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The attractive Options Ball Return differs in
one distinct way: its rack sits five inches
higher than the height of a traditional rack.
This height makes it easier for bowlers young
and old and short and tall to retrieve balls.

• Contemporary styling and glow-in-the-dark
hood and rail complement QubicaAMF
furniture for a coordinated look. Goes well
with other furniture, too.

• Unique Smarthpath™ distribution guarantees
alternate left/right ball placement for bowler
convenience.

• Rack provides ample 11-ball storage
capacity; or upgrade to a 15-ball rack.

• Optional lower rack storage accepts 10 more
balls, perfect for when large numbers of
bowlers use adjacent lanes.

• Strong power-l i f t  motor can l i f t  f ive
balls at once.

• The only power lift in the industry with its
motor and control box above the lane level
for easier access and maintenance.
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QubicaAMF ball returns
reliably return balls

Customers appreciate QubicaAMF ball returns for the way they quickly

and reliably return balls, for their clean contemporary styling, and for

their fun glow rails and hoods.

You’ll like QubicaAMF ball returns for those reasons as well – plus their

dependable operation, their powerful and industry-leading lift motors,

and their ease-of-maintenance.

QubicaAMF’s entire product line delivers the same benefits. You get

smooth, virtually trouble-free center operation. Your customers get a

satisfying bowling experience every visit. All of which explains why

QubicaAMF is the number one choice among owners, operators and

bowlers worldwide.

AND YOUR INVESTMENT.

From every angle, in every feature, Profile
Ball Returns are solid, stylish units.

• Contemporary design and glow-in-the-dark
hood and rails complement all QubicaAMF
furniture for a coordinated center look.

• Unique Smarthpath™ distribution guarantees
alternate left/right ball placement for bowler
convenience.

• Rack provides generous 11-ball storage
capacity; or upgrade to a 15-ball rack.

• Optional lower storage rack accepts 10
more balls.

• Strong power-lift motor can lift five balls
at once.

• Hood lifts off for easy access to controls
and motor.

• Available as a complete unit and as hood
and rack upgrade.

Profile Ball Return

Options Ball Return
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